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ALPHATEC S.A. and William Jacob Management Form an Alliance 
 

Houston, TX – 2017 – ALPHATEC S.A. and William Jacob Management, Inc. (WJM) announce 
the signing of a cooperation agreement under which the companies will mutually deliver 
engineering, construction and demolition/removal services for fixed and floating facilities. The 
services will include survey, inspection, engineering, project planning, procurement, well de-
commissioning/abandonment, facilities and pipeline cleaning and removal, construction 
management and maintenance. 

The strategic partnership leverages ALPHATEC S.A.’s fabrication, construction and maintenance 
expertise in fixed and mobile offshore production units with WJM’s proven execution of high 
stakes capital projects, such as Peregrino, Polvo, Azurite, Berkut and the breakthrough modular 
offshore rig facility (MORF). The sum of their efforts will target clients in need of removal of existing 
fixed and floating production facilities or maintenance of existing oil and gas structures.  

Under the agreement, WJM will also provide engineering and project management services to 
complement and strengthen the execution teams of ALPHATEC’s projects globally. 

The alliance will secure a unique combination of technical proficiency and operational capabilities 
sustaining a strong focus on innovative technical solutions that will improve operating results for 
customers. Ultimately, this alliance will provide an extended footprint for both firms, which have a 
market presence in major hubs throughout the oil and gas industry. This will, in turn, improve 
proximity to customers and enable diversity in locations for our complimentary engineering and 
project teams. 

 

About ALPHATEC S.A. 

ALPHATEC S.A. is an energy contractor that provides fabrication, maintenance and construction 
related services to the offshore and onshore oil and gas business sectors in Brazil.  ALPHATEC 
S.A. is based in Macae, RJ Brazil, complete with onsite fabrication and paint facilities.  Specific 
services provided by ALPHATEC S.A. include: maintenance and repair, construction, 
commissioning, inspection, decommissioning and abandonment, and additional complimentary 
services as required by Clients. 

For more information, visit http://www.alphatec.ind.br/site/ 

ALPHATEC Contact: Luiz Carlos Carrete e Silva, PMP 
  Diretor/CBO 
    Tel: +55 (22) 2773-0009 R: 514  |  E: luiz.carrete@alphatec.ind.br 
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About William Jacob Management  

Headquartered in Houston, Texas, William Jacob Management, Inc. is an independently owned, 
engineering and project management services firm. WJM provides full lifecycle support for some 
of the most demanding and complex capital projects in the energy industry, and is recognized for 
its elite proficiency in interfacing drilling and production facilities. With a multinational workforce 
and over 375 collective years of executive experience, William Jacob Management offers 
comprehensive capabilities and world-class expertise in:  Engineering, Project Management, 
Procurement, Construction, Commissioning / Startup, Operations, Maintenance and Regulatory 
Compliance.  
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WJM Contact: Michael P. Duffy, President 
   Tel: 281.497.8617  |  michael.duffy@williamjacob.com  
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